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First Kill Your Family is the only book published in American to reveal the full story behind the rise of
Joseph Kony and his Lord's Resistance Army. After savaging northern Uganda for twenty years and
slaughtering thousands and mutilating many more, Kony fled in 2006 to some of the most remote territory in
Africa. In a largely inaccessible region bordered by the failed states of South Sudan, the Central African
Republic, and the Congo, Kony and his cult-like army of child killers continue to terrorize local populations.
Most recently, they've turning the the wholesale slaughter of elephants in the jungles of northern Congo to
fund their army. 

The leader of the rebel army is the rarely seen Joseph Kony, a former witch doctor and self-professed spirit
medium who continues to evade justice and wield power from somewhere near the Congo~Sudan border.
Kony claims he not only can predict the future but also can control the minds of his fighters. And control
them he does: the Lord's Resistance Army consists of children who are abducted from their homes under
cover of night. As initiation, the boys are forced to commit atrocities--murdering their parents, friends, and
relatives--and the kidnapped girls are forced into lives of sexual slavery and labor.
 
Eichstaedt takes readers into the war-torn villages and refugee camps, talking to former child soldiers, child
"brides," and other victims. He examines the cult-like convictions of the army; how a pervasive belief in
witchcraft, the spirit world, and the supernatural gave rise to this and other deadly movements; and what the
global community can do to bring peace and justice to the region. This insightful analysis delves into the
war's foundations and argues that, much like Rwanda's genocide, international intervention is needed to stop
Africa's virulent cycle of violence.
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From reader reviews:

Elizabeth Parker:

The publication untitled First Kill Your Family: Child Soldiers of Uganda and the Lord's Resistance Army is
the guide that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be
shown to you actually. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, so the information that they share
to your account is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of First Kill Your Family: Child
Soldiers of Uganda and the Lord's Resistance Army from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free
time.

Arthur Elsberry:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family members
or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read the
book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day every
day to reading a guide. The book First Kill Your Family: Child Soldiers of Uganda and the Lord's Resistance
Army it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These folks
were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy
often the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not very
costly but this book offers high quality.

Ross Turner:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book First Kill Your Family: Child Soldiers of Uganda and the
Lord's Resistance Army was bright colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book First
Kill Your Family: Child Soldiers of Uganda and the Lord's Resistance Army has many kinds or type. Start
from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and believe you
are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it can make you feel
happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that will.

Stephen Stansbury:

Some people said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt this when they get a
half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book First Kill Your Family: Child Soldiers of
Uganda and the Lord's Resistance Army to make your personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of
reading expertise is developing when you like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to
learn it and mingle the feeling about book and examining especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like
to open a book and read it. Beside that the guide First Kill Your Family: Child Soldiers of Uganda and the
Lord's Resistance Army can to be your brand new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse using what



must you're doing of that time.
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