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In his highly anticipated new novel, Albom tenderly explores the themes of family, divorce, and regrets, and
the wish that we could have just one more day with a lost loved one.

Charley, a child of divorce, is forced to choose between his mother and his father. He grows into a man and
starts a family of his own. But one fateful weekend, he leaves his mother to secretly be with his father, and
she dies while he is gone. This haunts him for years and unravels his own young family. It leads him to
depression and drunkenness, and one night, he decides to take his life. But somewhere between this world
and the next, he encounters his mother again, in their hometown, and gets to spend one last day with her --
the day he missed and always wished he'd had. He asks the questions many of us yearn to ask, the questions
we never ask while our parents are alive. By the end of this magical day, Charley discovers how little he
really knew about his mother, the secret of how her love saved their family, and how deeply he wants a
second chance to save his own.
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From reader reviews:

Guy Gregory:

This For One More Day book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The
benefit you will get by reading this book is actually information inside this guide incredible fresh, you will
get facts which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This particular For One
More Day without we comprehend teach the one who reading it become critical in considering and
analyzing. Don't be worry For One More Day can bring any time you are and not make your carrier space or
bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This For
One More Day having very good arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not sense uninterested in
reading.

Michael Decker:

This book untitled For One More Day to be one of several books this best seller in this year, here is because
when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the
book retail outlet or you can order it through online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes
you more readily to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to
you to past this reserve from your list.

Dean Rakestraw:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information quicker
to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The book that recommended
to your account is For One More Day this e-book consist a lot of the information on the condition of this
world now. This book was represented how do the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer make
usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some exploration when he makes this
book. Honestly, that is why this book appropriate all of you.

Nancy Jones:

Some people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a guide. They are directly felt that when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book For One More Day to make your own reading is
interesting. Your skill of reading skill is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose easy book to
make you enjoy to see it and mingle the sensation about book and examining especially. It is to be 1st
opinion for you to like to wide open a book and read it. Beside that the e-book For One More Day can to be
your friend when you're sense alone and confuse in what must you're doing of their time.
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